
SAFETY
WARNING: CAUSES SERIOUS EYE IRRITATION. 
CAUSES SKIN IRRITATION.

PREVENTION: Wash hands thoroughly after han-
dling. Wear protective gloves and eye / face protec-
tion.

RESPONSE: IF IN EYES: Rinse cautiously with water 
for several minutes. Remove contact lenses, if pres-
ent and easy to do. Continue rinsing. If eye irritation 
persists: Get medical advice. IF ON SKIN: Wash with 
plenty of soap and water. Specific treatment (see 
section 4 of this SDS). If skin irritation occurs: Get 
medical advice. Take o� contaminated clothing and 
wash before reuse.

STORAGE & DISPOSAL: Store in accordance with 
local regulatory requirements. Dispose of contents/-
container in accordance with local regulations. 
Intended for industrial and commercial use only. For 
further information refer to the SDS. In emergencies 
call 000.

EMERGENCY TELEPHONE: POISONS CENTRE 
131126

DESCRIPTION
A multi-purpose organic acid based bathroom 
cleaner for maintaining clean and hygienic condi-
tions around toilets and all amenity areas.

DIRECTIONS
Toilet Bowls & Urinals & Heavy Build Up: Use as 
supplied through a squeeze pack, leave for 2 min-
utes, then rinse thoroughly.
Hand Scrubbing: Dilute 1:10 with water for tiles, toilet 
and shower areas. Scrub areas down and rinse 
thoroughly with water.
Floors: Dilute 1:60/100 with water.

Do not mix with any other chemical. Store in a cool 
area away from direct sunlight.

AREAS TO USE
Showers, baths, toilets, urinals.
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