
SAFETY
WARNING: SUSPECTED OF CAUSING CANCER. 
CAUSES SERIOUS EYE IRRITATION.

PREVENTION: Obtain special instructions before 
use. Do not handle until all safety precautions have 
been read and understood. Wash thoroughly after 
handling.

RESPONSE: IF IN EYES: Rinse cautiously with water 
for several minutes. Remove contact lenses, if pres-
ent and easy to do. Continue rinsing. If eye irritation 
persists: Get medical advice. IF exposed or con-
cerned: Get medical advice.

STORAGE & DISPOSAL: Store locked up, in accord-
ance with local regulatory requirements. Dispose of 
contents/container in accordance with local regula-
tions. Intended for industrial and commercial use 
only. For further information refer to the SDS. In 
emergencies call 000.

EMERGENCY TELEPHONE: POISONS CENTRE 

131126

DESCRIPTION
Invidually wrapped with a lavender fragrance, com-
pressed perfumed blocks for use in urinals and 
other areas where odours are a problem, 100 grams 
each. Red in colour.

DIRECTIONS
Scatter a few blocks around to eliminate malodours. 
To destroy moths and silverfish, place a number of 
blocks in a stocking and hang in wardrobes and 
linen cupboards.

Do not mix with any other chemical. Store in a cool 
area away from direct sunlight.

AREAS TO USE
Urinals.
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